
TRAVELERS VISITORS/HARTFORD CLUB PARKING GARAGE 
GPS ADDRESS: 50 PROSPECT STREET, HARTFORD, CT 06103

84 WESTBOUND
Take the Downtown Hartford exit (left exit). Go straight up State Street (which will turn into Central Row), then take a 
left onto Main Street. Take the next left onto Atheneum Square and go to the stop sign. The entrance to the garage 
is across the intersection to the right of the Hartford Club. Stop at the intercom at the top of the ramp and tell the 
attendant whom you are here to see.  

91 NORTHBOUND
Take the Capital Area exit (left exit). Take the second exit, Prospect Street, and take a right at the end of the exit 
onto Prospect Street. Go about a block, past the entrance to the Front Street Garage. Stop at the stop sign at the 
intersection of Prospect Street and Atheneum Square. The entrance to the garage is on the right just past the stop 
sign, at the brick driveway just before the Hartford Club. Stop at the intercom at the top of the ramp and tell the 
attendant whom you are here to see.    

84 EASTBOUND
Take the I-91 South exit to the first exit (Exit 29A - Capital Area). Take the second exit, Prospect Street, and take a 
right at the end of the exit onto Prospect Street. Go about a block, past the entrance to the Front Street Garage.  
Stop at the stop sign at the intersection of Prospect Street and Atheneum Square.  The entrance to the garage is on 
the right just past the stop sign, at the brick driveway just before the Hartford Club.  Stop at the intercom at the top 
of the ramp and tell the attendant whom you are here to see.    

91 SOUTHBOUND
Take the Capital Area Exit, 29A. Take the second exit, Prospect Street, and take a right at the end of the exit onto 
Prospect Street. Go about a block, past the entrance to the Front Street Garage. Stop at the stop sign at the 
intersection of Prospect Street and Atheneum Square. The entrance to the garage is on the right just past the stop 
sign, at the brick driveway just before the Hartford Club. Stop at the intercom at the top of the ramp and tell the 
attendant whom you are here to see.  

ROUTE 2
Take exit 1 (Downtown Hartford) over the Founders Bridge.  Go straight up State Street, (which will turn into Central 
Row), then take a left onto Main Street.  Take the next left onto Atheneum Square and go to the stop sign.  The 
entrance to the garage is across the intersection to the right of the Hartford Club. Stop at the intercom at the top of 
the ramp and tell the attendant whom you are here to see. 

ONCE YOU ARRIVE, PLEASE MENTION TO SECURITY THAT YOU ARE ATTENDING THE 
TRAVELERS CHAMPIONSHIP CHARITY CELEBRATION.
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